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Course Outcomes



SEMESTER I

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSI.1

COURSE NAME - ACCOUNTANCY AND FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT I

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Define the concept of Departmental Accounts , Hire purchase system of Accounting,
Manufacturing Final accounts

CO2: Develop an understanding on the allocating of expenses and income under
departmental accounts, calculation of Interest under hire purchase, to know the cost of
production under manufacturing accounts and methods to find out the cost of stock

CO3: Differentiate the journal transaction between the books of the buyer and the seller under
the Hire Purchase System, different methods of stock valuation, capital and revenue, receipts
and payment

CO4: Solve the problems based on the Departmental Accounts, Hire Purchase System,
Manufacturing Final Accounts

CO5: Apply the accounting standards in presenting financial statements

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSI.2

COURSE NAME - COMMERCE I

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Describe scope, functions and significance of business.

CO2: Classify various business objectives.

CO3: Illustrate on inter-relationship between Business and Environment.

CO4: Analyze the impact of International Trading Environment on Indian Business.



CO5: Understand Business Planning Process and stages in Business Unit Promotion.

CO6: Assess factors contributing to growth of Entrepreneurship in India.

CO7: Evaluate various Government Incentives offered to Entrepreneurs in India.

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSI.3

COURSE NAME - BUSINESS ECONOMICS I

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Analyse how individual decision-makers, both consumers and producers, behave in a
variety of economic situations.

CO2: Show structural and analytical reading and thinking skills.

CO3: Understand how micro economists build models, use data and conduct experiments.

CO4: Elucidate concepts related to utility, demand and supply in market.

CO5: Mark out concepts related to cost analysis.

CO6: Illustrate the theories with examples tables and diagrams.

CO7: Evaluate the students with orally in the classroom.

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSI.4

COURSE NAME - BUSINESS COMMUNICATION I

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Define the basic concepts of communication and explain the usage of modern means
and modes of communication

CO2: Identify the barriers to communication and find measures to overcome the barriers

CO3: Analyze and understand the various aspects of business ethics at personal, professional
and corporate level.

CO4: Design innovative approaches and develop the skills for commercial business
communication.



COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSI.7

COURSE NAME - FOUNDATION COURSE - I

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Recalling Multiplicity in India - Pluralistic society with ‘Unity in Diversity.’

CO2: Evaluating socio-economic problems related to women and government policies and
procedures.

CO3: Examining inequalities manifested due to caste system, region.

CO4: Analyzing causes of inter-group conflicts and Constitutional Provisions to resolve

CO5: Evaluating philosophy of the Indian Constitution as set in Preamble.

CO6: Acquire knowledge of functioning of Local Self- governments at grass -root levels

CO7: Learning experience and assessing with Project work /Assignments / presentation.

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSI.5

COURSE NAME - ENVIRONMENTAL STUDIES I

After completing the course, the learner will be able to: CO1.Explain the term environment &
ecosystem and discuss the importance of environmental studies. CO2: Classify natural
resources and choose proper resource conservation method. CO3: Illustrate the concept of
population explosion and associated problems. CO4: Explain the term urbanization and
understand the environmental problems for metropolitan cities. CO5: Discuss the
characteristics and need of smart and sustainable cities. CO6: Identify environmentally
significant places in the world map. CO7: Interpret the different thematic map techniques.

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSI.6

COURSE NAME - MATHEMATICAL AND STATISTICAL TECHNIQUES I

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Recall basics of permutations (arrangements) and combinations(selections).

CO2: Explain shares and dividends and interpret with example.



CO3: Evaluate problems in the areas of Mean, Median, Mode, Range, Variance and Standard
Deviation.

CO4: Define concept of Probability and Probability distributions.

CO5: Solve real life problems using Linear Programming Problems

CO6: Apply Statistical tools and techniques in decision making.

SEMESTER II

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSII.1

COURSE NAME - ACCOUNTANCY AND FINANCIAL MANAGEMENT II

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Define the concept of Single Entry, Consignment, and Branch Accounting

CO2: Develop an understanding on the calculation of fire insurance claim and consignment
stock

CO3: Differentiate the entries in various methods of branch accounts and consignment
accounts

CO4: Solve the problems based on Single Entry ,Consignment, Branch Accounting and Fire
Insurance Claims

CO5: Apply these fundamentals in the field of accountancy.

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSII.2

COURSE NAME - COMMERCE II

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Understand concept and characteristics of services.

CO2: Classify different types of services.

CO3: Compare Organized and Unorganized retailing in India.

CO4: Illustrate Store Formats and Non-Store Formats in India.



CO5: Differentiate between the concept of BPO, KPO and LPO.

CO6: Evaluate the impact of Foreign Direct Investment on Banking and Insurance Sector in
India.

CO7: Assess the viability and scope of E-Commerce in India.

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSII.3

COURSE NAME - BUSINESS ECONOMICS II

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Use marginal analysis for decision making.

CO2: Understand operations of markets under varying competitive conditions.

CO3: Describe concept of revenue total, average marginal revenue and its relationship of firm
and markets.

CO4: Demonstrate various forms of market and price determination concept of firm.

CO5: Describe the process of pricing strategies of firms.

CO6: Explain the Capital Budgeting process

CO7: Demonstrate the investment appraisal methods with problem solving techniques.

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSII.4

COURSE NAME - BUSINESS COMMUNICATION II

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Develop the skill for use of presentation effectively for any business communication

CO2: Formulate effective strategies for group communication, meetings, conferences.

CO3: Develop various measures required to enhance Public relations

CO4: Appraise and construct effective trade letters in day- to- day business scenarios and
cases.

CO5: Construct technical writing related to commercial business aspects in a cohesive
manner.



COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSII.7

COURSE NAME - FOUNDATION COURSE - II

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Understanding NEP 1991, concepts of privatization, liberalization, globalization.

CO2: Explaining concept of Human Rights: its evolution, UDHR, civil, political and
economic Rights.

CO3: Understanding the importance of Environmental studies, ecology its impact on human
life.

CO4: Recognizing Hereditary factors and Environment in personality development

CO5: Evaluating the agents of socialization in shaping human development

CO6: Analyzing motivational conflicts for peace and harmony.

CO7: Assessing the learner by use of ICT in project submission and developing reading skills
to help learning about current issues.

COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSII.5

COURSE NAME - ENVIRONMENTAL STUDIES II

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Classify solid waste and state the suitable methods for solid waste management in
urban and rural areas.

CO2: Describe the environmental problems associated with agriculture and industry.

CO3: Evaluate the importance of green business and green consumerism for sustainable
environment.

CO3: Classify tourism and describe the impact of tourism on economy, socio-culture and
environment.

CO4: Understand different environmental movements in India.

CO5: Use various methods of environmental management with the help of the modern
technology.

CO6: Identify environmentally significant places in Mumbai and Konkan map.



COURSE CODE - UBCOMFSII.6

COURSE NAME - MATHEMATICAL AND STATISTICAL TECHNIQUES II

After completing the course, the learner will be able to:

CO1: Recall basics of functions, derivatives and their applications.

CO2: Differentiate various types and methods of computing interest and Annuity with
examples.

CO3: Distinguish between various types of correlation and regression for the bivariate data.

CO4: Identify and solve simple examples on Probability distributions.

CO5: Apply Time Series and Index Numbers in appropriate examples.

CO6: Connect acquired knowledge and skills with practical problems in real life revenue
practices.


